o= 117 East Columbus Avenue
LOGAN Suite 100 + Bellefontaine, Oh 43311
commissioners@co.logan.oh.us
C ongr‘r":’s" sTi(y)r‘; e" r'so (office) 937-599-7283 ¢ (fax) 937-599-7268

John Bayliss + Joe Antram + Paul Benedetti

Brian Dunn DeDe Doss
Special Projects Coordinator Clerk Administrator

Resolution No. 124-20

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of May 19, 2020 with full
board present.

Mr. Paul Benedetti moved that the following resolution be adopted:
RE: AWARD BID FOR 2020 PAVEMENT MARKING- ENGINEER
WHEREAS, bids were received on May 14, 2020 for the 2020 Pavement Marking, and
WHEREAS, three bids were received from Dura Mark, Inc., Oglesby Construction Inc., A & A Safety, Inc., and

WHEREAS, the bids have been reviewed by the Logan County Engineer Office and a recommendation has been
made to award the bid to Dura Mark Inc., 2940 Progress Park Drive, Stow, Ohio 44224 in the amount of $172,215.49 and
enter into a contract for same, and

THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED, by the Logan County Board of Commissioners to award the bid to
Dura Mark, Inc. in the amount of $172,215.49 and enter into a contract for same.

Mr. Joe Antram seconded the motion.

Roll call resulted as follows:

Mr. John Bayliss‘ President

(bba S u}v/f

—

i s

Mr. Paul Benedetti, Vice President

Mr. Joseph M. Antram, Member 5

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of May 19, 2020.

b 0nllra s

e De Doss, Clerk/Administrator

G:\Commissioners\Clerk\Admin Clerk\2020 Resolutions\124-20 Awared Bid for 2020 Pavement
Marking -Engineer.doc, Page 1 of 1



DeDe Doss

From: W. Todd Bumgardner <tbumgardner@Iceo.us>
Sent: Friday, May 15, 2020 9:40 AM

To: DeDe Doss

Subject: May 14, 2020 Bid Award Packet

Attachments: 102319 - Award Packet LOG-CR VAR PM.pdf

Attached is a PDF of the award letter and low bidder submission along with our SAMS, BWC and State auditors checks.

Thanks,

W. Todd Bumgardner

Logan County Engineer's Office
Administrative Coordinator
1991 CR 13

P.O. Box 427

Bellefontaine, Ohio 43311
937-592-2791 - Office
937-599-2658 - Fax
tbumgardner@Iceo.us

This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of
the intended recipient(s) and may contain private, confidential and/or
privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or
distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
employee or agent responsible for delivering this message, please
contact the sender by reply e- mail and destroy all copies of the
original e-mail message.

According to Ohio Public Records Law written communications to or from
agencies/staff regarding this agency are public records and may be
available to the public and media upon request. Your e-mail may be
subject to public disclosure.



OFFICE OF THE
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER
P.O. BOX 427
1991 COUNTY ROAD 13
BELLEFONTAINE, OH 43311

www.lceo.us

SCOTT C. COLEMAN, P.E., P.S. Telephone: (937) 592-2791
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER Fax: (937) 599-2658
May 14, 2020 R
The Honorable Board of
117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100 LOGAN CO#,"_!TY COMMISSIONERS
Bellefontaine, OH 43311 MOTION 5
mp )k

Re: 2020 Pavement Marking Bid PER RESOLUTION# 13%-2.0

May 14, 2020-10:00 A.M. oED /62020
Gentlemen:

Loy

1 have reviewed the bids received on the above item and the bid tabulation is listed below.

Company Bid
Dura Mark, Inc. $172,215.49
Oglesby Construction Inc. $199,937.90
A & A Safety, Inc. $298,082.50

Therefore, we recommend that your honorable board award the bid to the low bidder as follows:
Dura Mark Inc., 2940 Progress Park Drive, Stow, Ohio 44224 in the amount of one hundred
seventy-two thousand two hundred fifteen dollars and forty-nine cents ($172,215.49) and enter
into a contract for same.

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for
Recovery Database. Dura Mark Inc. was not listed and we have retained the certified search
confirmation page in the project file.

This will be paid from Auto & Gas Funds.
Respectfully submitted,

Avbtl——

Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S.
Logan County Engineer

SCC/wtb
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Business Name

n ddess

_Phone

DURA MARK INC.
Oglesby Construction

Inc
A & A Safety, Inc.

2940 PROGRESS PARK DRIVE, STOW, OH 44224
1600 Toledo Road, Norwalk, OH 44857

1126 Ferris Road, Amelia, OH 45102

(330) 414-1763
(419) 668-8204

(513) 943-6100
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General Info

Total:

$172,215.49

Number Description

102319 Logan County Ohio - Various County Road Pavement Markings
Deadline PID # 102319

05/14/2020 02:00 PM UTC
ENGINEERS' ESTIMATE: $218,817.89

Vendor

DURA MARK INC. DBE GOAL: 0%

Submitted Allows zero unit prices and labor
05/14/2020 01:44 PM UTC Yes

Signed by Allows negative unit prices and labor
CURTIS BRITTON Yes

Opened

05/14/2020 02:02 PM UTC By tbumgardner@lceo.us

Page 1 of 14 05/14/2020



ATTACHMENT LIST

102319 - NTB LOG-CR VAR PM.pdf (154 KB)

102319 - General Notes LOG-CR VAR PM.pdf (608 KB)

102319 - Plans LOG-CR VAR PM.pdf (692 KB)

PI'I.D #102319 - LOG FY2021 PM - Davis Bacon Wage Rates.pdf (1.82 MB)

ODOT - LPA Template dated July 7, 2019.pdf (1.28 MB)

Page 2 of 14 05/14/2020



ADDENDUM

, Addendum Acknowledgement: (Click "+" to add additional fields) (Type "N/A" if not applicable)
! Addendum Number: * Addendum Date: *
CNIA N/A 5
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AFFIDAVIT

PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX *

YES

Page 4 of 14 05/14/2020



COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
! 8s!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, belhg duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business In, or with Logan County, Ohio,
and that:

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *

No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):
YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *

No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid

Page 5 of 14 05/14/2020



COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP
DBA

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
: ss:

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County, Ohio,
and that:

No bid

of: *

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):
YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *

. No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - PARTNERSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to camplete.
STATE OF OHIO:
! ss.

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County, Ghio,
and that:

No bid

known as: *
No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Délinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):
YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *

No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid

- Page 7 of 14 05/14/2020



COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - CORPORATION

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. 88!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County, Ohio,
and that:

[vHe is a duly authorized officer of the corporation *

named: *

Dura Mark Inc.

The business address of the bidder is: *
11384 Chamberlain Rd. ? P.O. Box 868 Aurora, Ohio 44202

Telephone: *
(330) 995-0883

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *

Was not charged with any delinquient personal taxes in Logan County, Ohio.

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows {click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" if this section does not
apply):

" YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
N/A $.00 $.00 $.00

Signature: *

Curtis Britton

Title: *

Vice President

Page 8 of 14 05/14/2020



BIDDER INFORMATION

Company *
DURA MARK INC.

Submitted by *
CURTIS BRITTON

Street, Post Office, City, State and Zip: *
2840 PROGRESS PARK DRIVE, STOW, OH 44224

Telephone *
(330) 414-1763

Federal Tax ID#: *
50,542,818

Page 9 of 14
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Item List

$172,215.49
g&'}; Description Quantity Units Pl;.'i'gi: Extension
WBCL ROAD MILES WATERBORNE GENTERLINE 354.0000 RM  $408.00 $144,432.00
- WBEL LANE MILES WATERBORNE EDGELINE 57.0000 LM $424.00  $24,168.00
: WBIM ROAD MILES WATERBORNE INDEX MARKINGS 128.0000 RM $10.00  $1,280.00
! i
. WBCH EEE\LSEL?;I\IGV(IE}DE'I\IVI;HITE’ WATERBORNE, 551.0000 FT $0.99 $545.49
WBTPB  *BLUE WATERBASE TRAFFIC PAINT 10.0000 GAL  $20.00 $200.00
 WBTPY  *YELLOW WATERBASE TRAFFIC PAINT 20.0000 GAL  $10.00 $200.00
WBTPW  *WHITE WATERBASE TRAFFIC PAINT 100.0000 GAL  $10.00  $1,000.00
GB GLASS BEADS 1,000.0000 LB‘. $0.39 $390.00

Page 10 of 14

Total: $172,215.49

05/14/2020



REQUIRED DOCUMENTS LIST

Name

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's

Check
Please upload a copy of your paper bid bond
here.

* Certificate of Compliance with Affirmative Action

. Program
Issued by the State EEO Coordinator dated prior
to the date fixed for the opening of bid

Ohio workers’ compensation certificate of

coverage
Submitted prior to contract execution

3 Required Documents

Omission Terms

| have electronically verified my bid bond in the
"Bid Bond" section above.

I will furnish prior to contract award

I will furnish prior to contract award

Page 11 of 14

Submitted
File

BID BOND
(LOGAN CO.)
DURA MARK
INC..pdf

EEO CERT. -
DURA MARK
ING..pdf

WORKERS
COMP. CERT.
- DURA MARK
INC..pdf
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BID GUARANTY

As specified in the Ohio Revised Code 153.54, a bidder must submit a bid guaranty in the form of either:
(1) a paper contract bond for the full amount (100%) of the bid, or

(2) a certified check, cashier's check, or letter of credit in the amount of 10% of the bid.

{3) an electronic bid bond for 10% of the bid.

Bond Percentage
10.00%

Guarantee Method *

Paper Bid Bond, Certified
Check, Cashier's Check, Letter
of Credit, or Paper Contract
Bond

[]l understand that in addition to the project Owner, ODOT shall be hamed as an obligee. *

[+l understand that original, wet-ink bid guaranty documents will be recieved “within 3-days post bid deadline.” *

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's Check, Letter of Credit, or Paper Contract Bond

* Confirmation *

| have provided a Contract Bond for 100.00% of the bid total amount and have uploaded a copy
in the Required Documents List at the bottom of this solicitation.

Page 12 of 14
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ODOT - LPA TEMPLATE COMPLIANCE and BIDDERS CERTIFICATION:

ODOT - LPA TEMPLATE COMPLIANCE:

The bidder hereby certifies that he (1) has ...., has not ...., participated in a previous contract or subcontract subject to the equal
opportunity clause, as required by Executive Orders 10925, 11114, or 112486,

(1) The Bidder must indicate the appropriate "has or has not" from above *

HAS

and that he (2) has ...., has not ...., filed with the Joint Reporting Committee, the Director of the Office of Federal Contract
Compliance, a Federal Government Contract Compliance, a Federal Government contracting or administering agency, or the
former President's Committee on Equal Employment Opportunity, all reports due under the applicable filing requirements.

(2) The Bidder must indicate the appropriate "has or has not" from above* *

HAS

All Bidders shall submit a DBE Ultilization Plan at the time of bid setting forth specific information demonstrating how the Bidder
will achieve the DBE goal. By submiiting a DBE Utilization Plan, the Bidder is affirming that they will be using the DBE firms
identified in the Utilization Plan to meet the DBE contract goal. The DBE Utilization Plan shall be submitted with Formstack at
time of bid submission. Any bids received without electronic submission of the DBE Utilization Plan at or before bid time, will be
deemed unresponsive, Bidders shall submit their DBE Utilization Plans via: https://odot.formstack.com/forms/dbe_copy.
This file contains the current list of certified DBEs and is updated regularly. The DBE Ultilization Plan must be filled out
completely and submitted prior to bid opening.

DBE Utilization Plan submission is completed: *

YES

Page 13 of 14 05/14/2020



BIDDER'S CERTIFICATION:

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime
contract bidder, does hereby certify to and agree to all the required
contract provisions and documents outlined within the ODOT - LPA
Template, final plans, wage rates, utility notes, proposal notes, and

- bidders notices each furnished in their entirety within the
attachment list above.

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime
contract bidder, does hereby agrees to furnish all labor, materials,
and equipment for the (project listed in the general info section)
and perform all work incident thereto in accordance with the plans
and specifications thereof and subject to the satisfaction and
acceptance by the County Engineer at the unit prices provided on
the proceeding pages.

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime
contract bidder, does hereby agrees to enter into a contract within
ten (10) days; to complete the said improvement and will furnish
the required bond for the payment of all bills for damages, labor,
and material arising from the construction of said improvement.

Signature of Authorized Officer: * Date: _ /| | |*
Curtis Britton 5M14/2020
Title: *

Vice President

Page 14 of 14 05/14/2020



THE CINUINNA T INDURANUE WCUIVIFAIN Y
CINCINNATI, OHID

BID GUARANTY
AND CONTRACT
BOND

(SECTION 153.571 Revised Code)

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, that we, the undersigned

Dura Mark Inc.

as Principal, and THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY (licensed to do business in the State of Ohio), as Surety, are hereby
held and firmly bound unto the

Logan County Commissioners & Ohio Department of Transportation

herelnafter called the Obligee, in the penal of the dollar amount of the bid submitted by the Principal to the Obligee on 5-14-2020
lo undertake the project known as :

2020 Federal Aid Logan County Pavement Marking Program PID #102319

The penal sum referred to herein shall be the dollar amount of the Principal's bid to the Obligee, incorporating any additive or
deductive allemate proposals made by the Principal on the date referred to above to the Obligee, which are accepted by the Obligee.
In no case shall the penal sum exceed the amount of

dollars ($ }
(If the above line is left blank, the penal sum will be the full amount of the Principal's bid, including alternates. Allemalively, If
completed, the amount stated must not be less than the full amount of the bid, including altemates, in dollars and cents. A percentage
is not acceptable.) For the payment of the penal sum well and truly to be made, we hereby jointly and severally bind ourselves, our
heirs, executors, administrators, successors, and assigns.
THE CONDITION OF THE ABOVE OBLIGATION IS SUCH, that whereas the above-named Principal has submitted a bid on

the above referred to project; _
NOW, THEREFORE, if the Obligee accepts the bid of the Principal and the Principal fails to enter into a proper contract in

accordance with the bid, plans, detalls, specifications, and bills of material; and in the event the Principal pays to the Obligee the
difference not to exceed ten percent of the penalty hereof between the amount specified in the bid and such larger amount for which the
Obligee may In good faith contract with the next lowest bidder to perform the work covered by the bid; or in the event the Obligee does
not award the contract to the next lowest bidder and resubmits the project for bidding, the Principal will pay the Obligee the difference
not to exceed ten percent of the penalty hereof between the amount specified in the bid, or the costs, in connection with the
resubmission, of printing new contract documents, required adverlising, and printing and mailing nolices to prospective bidders,
whichever is less, then this obligation shall be vold, otherwise to remain In full force and effect, [f the Obligee accepts the bid of the
Principal and the Principal within ten days after the awarding of the contracl enters into a proper contract in accordance with the bid,
plans, detalls, specifications, and bills of material, which said contract is made a part of this bond the same as though set forth herein;
and

IF THE SAID Principal shall well and faithfully perform each and every condition of such contract; and indemnify the Obligee

against all damage suffered by failure to perform such contract according to the provisions thereof and In accordance with the plans,
delails, specifications, and bills of material therefor; and shall pay all lawful claims of subcontraclors, materialmen, and laborers, for
labor performed and materials furnished in the carrying forward, performing, or completing of said contract; we agreeing and assenting
that this undertaking shall be for the benefit of any materiaimen or laborer having a Jusl claim, as well as for the Obligee herein; then this
obfigation shali be void; otherwise the same shall remain in full force and effect; it being expressly understood and agreed that the
liability of the Surety for any and all claims hereunder shall in no event exceed the penal amount of this obligation as herein stated.

THE SAID Surely hereby stipulates and agrees that no modifications, omissions, or additlons, in or to the terms of said

contract or in or to the plans and speciﬁcationa.ttmem &hall in any wise affect the obligations of said Surety on this bond, and it does
hereby waive notice of any such modificatioy®, Swpsm,@ additions to the terms of the contract or to the work or to the specifications.
)

SIGNED AND SEALED this 144" S3y0EoHf3 -,

et

s Kl q%cz (@
PRINCIPAL-&Dur Mark tnc. 3 2 O PARN,
BY: fé@m : 1 <U02! ¢
' R (Seal) &
TITLE: V|C{T Qbﬁ’ffasm—’ ‘," “ONig ..*" ~
2, "_ \\‘
""'lumn“““
THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY SURETY AGENT'S ADDRESS:
BY: U\ oo ™. m a_ej’.m_ﬂ,cq Todd Associates, Inc.
Attorney-in-Fact Rosann M. Mackney (8%al) Agency Name
SURETY COMPANY ADDRESS: 23825 Commerce Park Drive, Suite A
Street
6200 S. Gilmore Road
in_44122
City State ZIP

Fairfield OH 45014-5141




THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY
Fairfield, Chio
POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY, a corparation organized under the laws of
the State of Qbio, and having its principal office in the City of Fairfield, Ohio, does hereby constitule and appoint

Edward J. Hyland; Michelina DilLillo; Douglas R. Musgrave;
Rosann M. Mackney and/or William E. Castle

of Beachwood, Ohio its true and lawful Attomney(s)-in-Fact to sign, execute, seal
and deliver on its behalf as Surely, and as its act and deed, any and all bonds, policies, undertakings, or other like instruments, as follows:
Any such obligations in the United States, up to
Ten Million and No/100 Dollars ($10,000,000,00).
This appointinent is made under and by authority of the following resolution passed by the Board of Directors of said Company
at 2 meeting held in the principal office of the Company, a quorum being present and voling, on the 6" day of December, 1958, which
resofution is still in effect:

“RESOLVED, thal the I'resident or any Vice President be hereby authorized, and empowered to appoint Atiomeys-in-
Facl of the Company to execute any and alt bonds, policies, undertakings, or other like instruments on behalf of the
Corporation, and may authorize any officer or any such Attomey-in-Fact to affix the corporate seal; and may with or
without cause modify or revoke any such appointment or atthority. Any such writings so executed by such Attomeys-in-
Fact shall be binding upon the Company as if they had been duly executed and acknowledged by the regularly elected
officers of the Company.”

This Power of Altomey is signed and sealed by facsimile under and by the authority of the following Resolution adopted by the
Board of Directors of the Company at a meeting duly called and held on the 7* day of December, 1973.

“RESOLVED, that the signature of the President or a Vice President and the seal of the Company may be affixed by
facsimile on any power of altomey granted, and the signature of the Secretary or Assistant Secretary and the scal of the
Company may be affixed by facsimile to any cerificate of any such power and any such power of certificate beuring
such facsimile signature and seal shall be valid and binding on the Company. Any such power so executed aud sealed
and certified by certificate so executcd and sealed shall, with respect to any bond or undertaking to which it is attached,
continue to be valid and binding on the Campany.”

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY has caused these presents to be scaled with its corparate
seal, duly attested by its Vice President this 10™ day of May, 2012,

THE CINCINNATI] INSURANCE COMPANY

Sj\j\‘hkk A

Vice President

STATE OF OHIO ) ss:
COUNTY OF BUTLER )

On this 10" day of Muy, 2012, before me come the above-named Vice President of THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY,
to me personally known to be the officer described herein, and acknowledged that the sea) affixed to the preceding instrument is the corporate
seal of said Company and the corporale seal and the signature of the officer were duly affixed and subscribed to said instrument by the

authority and direction of said corporation.
2Dt JHH

g,
SERIAL &
(/ MARK J. HKLLEH. Attorney al Law
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF OHIO

&
§ My commission has no explalion
» dale. Seclion 147.03 O.A.C.

e

x
M

““ﬂ‘l

1, the undersigned Secretary or Assistant Secretary of THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY, hercby cerlify that tic above
is a truc and correct copy of the Original Power of Altomey issued by said Company. and do hereby further cerlify that the said Power of
Altorney is still in [ull force and effect.

GIVEN under iy hand and seal of said Company at Fairficld, Ohio.

day of . '
May 2020 50# /?

Assistant Secretary

BN-1005 (5/12)



Office of Risk Assessment Ohio Department of Insurance
50 West Town Street

Third Floor - Sulle 300 Mike DeWine - Governor
Columbus, Ohio 43215 R
(614)644-2658 Jilian Froment - Director
Fax(614)644-3256 Certificate of Compliance

www.insurance.ohio.gov

[ssucd  06/26/20]9
Effective 07/01/2019
Expires 06/3072020

I, Jillian Froment, hereby certify that I am the Director of Insurance in the State of Ohio and have supcrvision of
insurance business in said State and as such I hereby certify that

CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY, THE

of Ohio is duly organized under the laws of this State and is uuthorized to iransact the business of insurance under the
following scetion(s) of the Ohio Revised Cuode:

Section 3929.01 (A)

Accident & Health Multiple Peril - Favmowners
Alrcraft Multiple Peril - tHomeowners
Allied Lines Other Liability

Boiler & Machinery Private Passenger Auto - Liability
Burglary & Theft Private Pussenger Auto - No Faull
Commercial Auto - Liubility Private Possenger Auto - Physical Damage
Commercial Auvto - No Fault Surety

Commercial Auto - Physical Damage Workers Compensation

Credit

Earthquake

Fidelity

Finuncial Guarunty

Fire

Glass

Inland Marine

Medical Malpractice

Multiple Peril - Commercial

CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY . THE, cortified in its annual statement to this Department as of December

31,2018 that it hus edmitted assets in the amount of $13,147,818,826, linbilitiss in the amount of $8,228,714,453, und
surplus of at least $4,919,104,373,

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, 1 have hereunto subscribed my name and caused my seal to be affixed at Columbus, Ohio,
this day and date.

e - »ta
A,___.]_,_,ﬂf ."':/'t-“\.,‘-.-’

('l
Jillian Froment, Director

INS7230{Rev.6/2003) Accreditad by the National Assoclation of Insurance Commissionars [NAIC)

CIC Torm #BN-1423-19



Z u ii h The Cincirnail Insurarice Company = The Cincinnati Indemnity Company
s et The Cincinnati Casually Company = The Cincinnati Specialty Underwriters Insurance Company

CINCINNATI

The Cincinnati Lile Insurance Company

INSURANCE COMPANIES
THE CINCINNAT! INSURANCE COMPANY
FINANCIAL STATEMENT
DECEMBER 31, 2018

ASSETS
Cash $ 350,693,038
Bonds 6,336,078,008
Stocks 6,648.215,691
Agents Balance Receivable 1,689,310,724
All Other Admitted Assets 403,355,326
TOTAL ADMITTED ASSETS $14,327.652,787

LIABILITIES
Reserve for Losses and Loss Expense $ 5,198,504,877
Reserve for Unearned Premiums 2,539,425 908
All Other Liabilities 870,045,949
Capital $ 3,586,355
Surplus 5.616,089,700
5,619.676.055

TOTAL LIABILITIES & EQUITY $14,327.652,787
State of Ohio
County of Butler
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Theresa A. Hoffer, Treasurer of The Cincinnati Insurance Company, being duly sworn for herself,
deposes and says that she is the above described officer of the said company and that the above
Financial Statement as of December 31, 2019 is frue and correct to the best of her knowledge and belief.
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Theresa A. Hoffer ¢ 7 X Rachel E. Underwood
Senior Vice President, Treasurer Notary Public
Inand For the State of Ohio
Subscribed and sworn before me this 2™ day of Mar My Commission Expires
L D7 June 2022
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Mailing Address: P.O. Box 145496 « Cincinnati, Ohio 45250-5496 = Headquarters: 6200 5. Gilmore Road » Fairfield, Ohlo 45014.5141

cifincom » 513-870-2000
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01/30/2020

Mike Krenn

Dura Mark, Inc.
PO Box 868
Aurora, OH 44202

Subject: Certificate of Compliance Certification
Status: Conditional
Effective Dates: 01/30/2020 through 07/27/2020

Dear Mike Krenn:

The Equal Opportunity Division of the Ohio Department of Administrative Services (Division) hereby issues
Dura Mark, Inc. a Certificate of Compliance. The Certificate shall be in force for 180 days from the date of

issuance.

Section 9.47 of the Revised Code requires the Division to review affirmative action programs and plans of
each company desiring to participate on state-assisted construction contracts and determine whether that
company has violated any affirmative action programs and goals for which that company was obligated to
meet during the preceding five years. Based on the above-referenced review, the Division has found no such

violation(s).

Please be advised that for Dura Mark, Inc. to maintain certification status, Dura Mark, Inc, must continue to
ensure equal employment opportunities in accordance with applicable State and Federal EEO laws, rulss,
regulations and guidelines, and meet those contractual obligations for which Dura Mark, Inc. has agreed.

Sincerely,

Gl dutronL-

Eric M. Seabrook

Deputy Director

State EEO Coordinator

Equal Opportunity Division 614-466-8380 | Phone

4200 Surface Road 614-728-5628 | FAX

Columbus, Ohio 43228 das.eod@das.ohlo.gov| email: das.chio.gov

The State of Ohio is an equal cpportunity employer



* § Bureau of Workers’ 30 W. Spring St.
lO i Compensation , Colurnbus, OH 43215
Certificate of Ohio Workers' Compensation

This certifies that the employer listed below participates in the Ohio State Insurance Fund as required by law.
Therefore, the employer is entitled to the rights and benefits of the fund for the period specified. This certificate
is only valid if premiums and assessments, including installments, are paid by the applicable due date. To
verify coverage, visit www.bwc.ohio.gov, or call 1-800-644-6292.

This cettificate must be conspicuously posted.

Policy number and employer ' Period Specified Below
01391944 07/01/2019 to 07/01/2020
DURA MARK INC g s

PO BOX 868
AURORA, OH 44202-0868

www.bwe.ohio.gov
Issued by: BWC

NIRRT,

Administrator/CEQ

You can reproduce this certificate as needed.

Ohio Bureau of Workers' Compensation

Required Posting

Section 4123.54 of the Ohio Revised Code requires notice of
rebuttable presumption. Rebuttable presumption means an
employee may dispute or prove untrue the presumption (or
belief) that alcohol, marihuana or a controlled substance not
prescribed by the employee's physician is the proximate cause
(main reason) of the work-related injury.

The burden of proof is on the employee to prove the presence of
alcohol, marihuana or a controlled substance was not the
proximate cause of the work-related injury. An employee who
tests positive or refuses to submit to chemical testing may be
disqualified for compensation and benefits under the Workers'
Compensation Act. '

Oh 2 Bureau of Workers’
10 Compensation

You must post this language with the Certificate of Ohio Workers' Compensation.

DP-29 BWC-1629 (Rev. Jan. 10, 2019)
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w A M A NEW WAY TO SIGN 1IN - If you already have > Login
a SAM account, use your SAM email for login.gov. * 28

STEM FOR AWARD MANAGEMENT
Login.gov FAQs

\ ALERT: SAM.gov will be down for scheduled maintenance Saturday, 06/13/2020 from 8:00 AM to 1:00 PM

. DURA MARK, INC. 11884 Chamberlin Rd
Entity Dashboard  pyns: 141538681 CAGE Code: 7WHFo Aurora, OF, 44202,
Status: Active UNITED STATES
Expiration Date: 02/18/2021
» Entity Overview Purpose of Registration: All Awards
» Entity Registration Entity Overview
» Core Data
» Assertions | Entity Registration Summary
» Reps & Certs Name: DURA MARK, INC.
+ POCs Business Type: Business or Organization
Last Updated By: CURTIS BRITTON
» Exclusions Registration Status: Active

Activation Date: 02/19/2020

» Active Exclusions ..
Expiration Date: 02/18/2021

¢+ Inactive Exclusions l
» Excluded Family

Members l Exclusion S ary" " |

T S leae st s o o et . . »
|; "RETURN TO SEARCH ]] Active Exclusion Records? No

Search Records Disclairers FAPIIS. gov
Data Access Accessibility  GSA.gov/IAE

S Ié\ Check Status Privacy Policy GSA.gov
About USA.gov
BM-P-20200424-1037 Help
VIWWo

This is a 1.8, Genernl Services Administration Federal Government computer system that is "FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY." This system is subject to monitoring. Individuals found
performing vnanthorized activities are subject to disciplinary action including crinvnal proseention.



0 Records found criteria: Name Search: dura mark inc , Entity Search: -,

Month: -, Year: -, Status: Unresolved
Name Government Entity Amount Date Certified Resolved

There are no items to display

Back to Search (http://ffr.ohioauditor.gov/)




Employer/MCO look-up

Details

Employer

\ame
JURA MARK INC

JBA
N/A

Yolicy number
1391944-0

dolicy status
\CTIVE

Address
1384 Chamberlain Rd
\urora, OH 44202-9360

Yolicy type
RIVATE EMPLOYER

MCO

Number
10010

Jame
_AREWORKS

\ddress
>0 Box 182726
“olumbus, OH 43218-2726

>hone number
188-627-7586

Search again




